City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
1 Deleted
2 7 Passenger Mini Van with Curb and Street Side Doors 6

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

$29,926.00
$179,556.00

2022 Chrysler]
Voyager L

9 SPD Trans.

36 mo. 36k Miles, 5 yr|
100k Miles

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

160 Days

9/30/2022
9/3/2022

No

No Bid

No Bid

$33,340.00
$200,040.00

2022 Chrysler
Voyager LX
Chrysler 3.6L V6 287
hp

9 spd Auto
3yr/36,000
5yr/100,000 Limited
Powertrain

Any Chrysler Dealer
Any Chrysler

120-180 Est
July 2022

March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
3 7 Passenger Mini Van with Curb Side Door 1

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

$29,825.00
$29,825.00

2022 Chrysler|
Voyager
Voyager L

9 spd.
3yr 36k Miles, 5k 100k
Miles

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

160 Days

9/30/2022
9/30/2022

No

No Bid

No Bid

$33,340.00
$33,340.00

2022 Chrysler
Voyager

Chrysler 3.6L V6 287
hp

9 spd auto
3yr/36,000
5yr/100,000 Limited
Powertrain

Any Chrysler
Any Chrysler

120-180 Est

July 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
4 7 Passenger Mini Van with Germ Barrier: 6

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

$30,474.00
$182,844.00

2022 Chrysler|
Voyager|
Voyager L

9 SPD.
3yr 36k Miles, 5k 100k
Miles

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

160 Days

9/30/2022
9/30/2022

No

No Bid

No Bid

$33,890.00
$203,340.00

2022 Chrysler
Voyager XL
Chrysler 3.6L V6
287hp

9 spd Auto
3yr/36,000
5yr/100,000 Limited
Powertrain

Any Chrysler

Any Chrysler

120-180 Est
July 2022

March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
5 Mini Cargo Vanc w/Shelving and Ladder Rack 7

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Manufacturer of Shelving Offered:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$29,796.00
$208,572.00

2022 Ford Transit
Connect Cargo Van
Ford 2.0L GDI |4 Gas
162 H.P.

Ford 8-speed
SelectShift Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|
78219

KGM

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

No Bid

$29,864.00
$209,048.00

2022 Ram Promaster
City
Ram 2.4L Tigershark

178 hp
9 spd Auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain
Any Ram Dealer

Any Ram Dealer

Kargo Master
150-240 Est
August 2022

April 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
6 Full Size Cargo Van w/Shelving and Ladder Rack 8

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Manufacturer of Shelving Offered:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$37,282.00
$298,256.00

2022 Transit-250
Cargo Low Roof Van

Ford 3.5L PFDi V6
Flex Fuel 275 H.P.
Ford 10-spd
Automatic
w/OD+Selectshift

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219

Ranger

350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

$36,867.00
$294,936.00

2022 Ford Transit
Cargo

Ford 3.5 Liter]
Ecoboost 275 HP
10 speed automatic

3yr./36,000
5yr/100,000
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West|
San Antonio, TX
78230

Cargo Master 3yr]
component/lifetime
structure

125 Days
TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
7 Sport Utility Vehicle - High Curb Clearance 2

Price Each:
Total:
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:

Price Differential:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

No Bid

$44,903.75
$89,807.50
38.08%

$24,769.50

2022 Ford Expedition
XL

Ford 3.5 Liter|
Ecoboost 375 HP
10 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West|
San Antonio, TX|
78230

120 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$32,519.00
$65,038.00

2022 Jeep Wrangler
Sport Unlimited
Jeep 2.0L 14 turbo
270hp

8 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain
Any Jeep dealer
Any Jeep dealer]

120-160 Est

August 2022
April 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
8 Deleted
9 1/2 Ton Extended Cab 4x2/RWD Truck w/Strobes 24

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$28,962.00
$695,088.00

2022 Ford F150
Super Cab 4x2
Ford 3.3L V6 PFDI
290 H.P.

Ford 10-speed
Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|
78219

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$28,295.00
$679,080.00

2022 Ford F-150
Ford 3.3 Liter V6
PFDI 260 HP

10 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West

San Antonio, TX|
78230

120 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$31,077.00
$745,848.00

2022 Ram 1500
classic Quad Cab
Ram 3.6L V6 305 hp
8 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain

Any Ram Dealer

Any Ram

120-180 Est

September 2022
May 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
10 3/4 Ton Extended Cab 4x4/AWD, Long Bed Truck With 1

Accessories
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Toolbox Offered

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$39,358.00
$39,358.00

2022 Ford F250
Super Cab 4x4
Ford 6.2L 2-valve
SOHC EFI NA V-8
Flex Fuel 385 H.P.
Ford TorgShift-G

6 speed Auto
w/SelectShift]

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219
Betterbuilt-73210169

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$34,741.00
$34,741.00

2022 Ford F-250

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West San
Antonio, TX 78230

RKI Toolbox Ranch
Hand Grillguard Eco

120 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
11 1/2 Ton, Crew CAB, 4x4/AWDShort Bed Truck 3

w/Responder Upfitting
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE

Net HP):
Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Make & Model of Toolbox Offered

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$84,717.00
$254,151.00

2022 Ram 1500
Classic Crew Cab
Ram 5.7L Hemi V8
395hp

8 spd auto

3yr/36,000 5/100,000
limited powertrain

Any Ram
Any Ram

180-240 days
August 2022

March 2022

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
12 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4x4/AWD, Long Bed Truck 1

With Camper

Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Camper Shell Offered:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$43,582.00
$43,582.00

2022 Ford F250 4x4
Crew Cab

Ford 6.2L 2 valve
SOHC EFI NA V8 Flex
Fuel 385 H.P.

Ford TorgShift-G 6
speed Auto
w/SelecShift

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|
78232

Leer]

350 Days
10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$37,410.00
$37,410.00

Ford F-250 Crew Cab
4x4

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX|
78230

Leer Commercial
Fiberglass Cap
120 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$45,593.00
$45,593.00

2022 Ram 2500 Crew
Cab 4x4 long bed

Ram 6.4L Hemi V8
410hp

8 spd auto

3yr/36,000 5yr/100,00
Limited Powertrain
Any Ram Dealer

Any Ram Dealer

Leer
120-180 Est

August 2022
March 2022

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
13 1 Ton Extended Cab Pick Up, Long Bed, OEM Color 1

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$41,956.00
$41,956.00

2022 F350 4x2 Super
Cab 4x2

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
475 H.P.

Ford TorgShift 10-
Speed Automatic
Base 36. months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|
78219

350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

$39,931.00
$39,931.00

2022 Ford F-350
Supercab

Ford 6.7 Liter|
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West|
San Antonio, TX|
78230

120 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
14 3/4 Ton Extended Cab 4x2/RWD Truck, Gasoline, dark 1

color
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$33,354.00
$33,354.00

2022 F250 4x2 Super
Cab 4x2

Ford 6.2L 2 valve EFI
NA V8 Flex Fuel 385
H.P.

Ford TorgShift-G

6 speed Auto
w/SelectShift

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavende Grande Ford
4562 |IH-10 East

San Antonio, TX
78219

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$27,799.00
$27,799.00

2022 Ford F-250
Supercab

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX
78230

120 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
15 Medium Duty, Crew Cab, 15 ft Stake/Flat Bed Truck 1
Price Each: No Bid $96,638.00 $118,737.00 No Bid No Bid $104,000.00
Total: $96,638.00 $118,737.00 $104,000.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 F-750 Diesel 2022 Ford F650 2022 International
Crew Cab MUG607
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Ford 6.7L Power| Ford 6.7 Liter Cummins B6.7 280
Net HP): Stroke V8 270 H.P. Powerstroke Diesel HP

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Stake/flatbed and Lift Gate Offered:

Stake/flatbed and Lift Gate Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

Ford Torqueshift 6-
speed Automatic

Base - 24 months

Cavender Grande
Ford
4562 |IH-10 East|

San Antonio, TX
78219

UT1596TP Stake Bed
/ 89-30 TP36 Rail
Gate

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

300 HP
6 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX
78230

CM Bed Tommy Life

CM Bed 1 year limited
Tommy lift 1 year
limited/ 2 yr

140 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

Allison 2500 RDS

See warranty
attachment
Kyrish Truck Center

1380 Ackerman Rd
San Antonio, TX
78219

UT1596TP

TommyGate 89-30
TP36 1 year parts +
labor

365 Days

1/1/22
12/22/21




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
16 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, Diesel, 4x4/AWD, Long Bed, 1

SRW
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$45,706.00
$45,706.00

2022 Ford F350 4x4
Regular Cab

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
475 H.P.

Ford TorgShift 10
speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|

78219

350 Days
10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$42,365.00
$42,365.00

2022 Ford F-350 Reg.
Cab

Ford 6.7 Liter]
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX|

78230

120 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$49,126.00
$49,126.00

2022 Ram 3500

Cummins 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 370 hp

6 spd auto

3yr/36,000 5/100,000
Unlimited Powertain +
Motor

Any Ram

Any Ram

120-180 Est

August 2022
March 2022

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
17 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 4x4/AWD, Long Bed, 2

SRW
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$48,664.00
$97,328.00

2022 F350 4x4 Crew|
Cab

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
475 H.P.

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$45,998.00
$91,996.00

2022 Ford F-350 Crew
Cab

Ford 6.7 Liter|
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX|

78230

120 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$53,682.00
$107,364.00

2022 Ram 3500

Cummins 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 370 hp

6 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
Motor

Any Ram

Any Ram

120-180 Est

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
18 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 4x2/RWD, Long Bed, 1

DRW
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Toolbox Offered:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$47,928.00
$47,928.00

2022 Ford F350 4x2
Crew Cab

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
475 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10
speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219

RKI ST63WHT

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$44,925.00
$44,925.00

2022 Ford F-350
DRW

Ford 6.7 Liter]
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West|
San Antonio, TX

78230

RKI Toolbox RKI
Limited Lifetime on

120 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$52,471.00
$52,471.00

2022 Ram 3500 Crew
Cab 4x2 DRW

Cummins 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 370 hp

6 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
Motor

Any Ram

Any Ram

Not Provided

120-180 Est

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
19 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, Diesel Drw 1

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Toolbox offered:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$43,682.00
$43,682.00

2022 Ford F350
Regular Cab 4x2
Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
475 H.P.

Ford TorgShift 10
speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|
78219

No Tool Box

350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

$39,999.00
$39,999.00

2022 Ford D-350 Reg
Cab Diesel

Ford 6.7 Liter]
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West|
San Antonio, TX

78230

N/A

120 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$46,795.00
$46,795.00

2022 Ram 3500

Cummins 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 370hp

6 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
Motor

Any Ram

Any Ram

No Toolbox in Spec
120-180 st

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
20 3/4 Ton Diesel Pick Up Dump Bed Insert w/Crane 1

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Dump Insert & Cover and Fold-Away Bumper Cran
Offered:

Dump Insert & Cover and Fold-Away Bumper Cran
Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$65,404.00
$65,404.00

2022 Ford F250
Regular Cab 4x2
Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
475 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10
speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX

78219

Truck Craft TC101
Dump Insert/
105667W Tupper
Western Mule A-2000
Fold-Away Crane

12 months
350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
21 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 4x2/RWD, Custom Flat 1

Bed, DWR
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Lift Gate Offered:

Lift Gate Waranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$60,178.00
$60,178.00

2022 Ford F350 Crew
Cab 4x2 Chassis

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
330 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10
speed

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East San
Antonio, TX 78219
Maxon 1600 #

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$58,811.00
$58,811.00

2022 Ford F-350 Crew
Chassis Cab

Ford 6.7 Liter]
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West San
Antonio, TX 78230

CM truck Bed Tommy,
Gate

CM Truck Bed 1 year
limited warranty
Tommy Gate 2 yr
limited warranty|

130 Days
TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$67,024.00
$67,024.00

2022 Ram 3500
Cummins 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 360 hp
6 spd

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
Motor

Any Ram

Any Ram

Tommy Gate

1yr.

120-180 Est

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
22 1 Ton Single Cab Pick Up, Long Bed, with Refuse Insert 1

(Turnkey Unit)
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Refuse Insert Offered:

Refuse Insert Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$73,298.00
$73,298.00

2022 Ford F350
Regular Cab 4x2
Ford 6.2L 2-Valve
SOHC EFI NA VS8
385 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10-
speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219

Perkins Satellite 6YD
Refuse Body Dump
Insert

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$72,242.00
$72,242.00

2022 Ford F-350
Regular Cab

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

10 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles

5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX
78230

Perkins satelite 6yd
2000LB

2 yr limited warranty

130 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$76,502.00
$76,502.00

2022 Ram 3500

Ram 6.4L Hemi V8
410 hp

8 spd auto
3/36,000 5/100,000

limited powertrain
Any Ram

Any Ram

Perkins 6yd 2000#
dump insert

2 yr.
150-200 Est
August 2022

March 2022

No

$68,998.00
$68,998.00

2022 Ford F350
Regular Cab 4X2

Ford 6.2 L 2-Valve EFI
V8 W/ 385 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10
Speed Automatic
Base 36 months or|
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East

San Antonio, TX
78219

PERKINS 6YD
SATALITE
CONTAINER W/
D6098 LIFTER. 12
VOLT 5 FUNCTION
POWER PACK,
CABLE KIT W/ 6
BUTTON PENANDT]
AND 4 BUTTON
CONTROL. 6YD FULL
HYDRUALIC METAL
SWEEP COVER. TOP
LIGHTS PACKAGE
(2X)

1 Year

350 Days

10/31/2021
10/31/2021

No

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
23 1 Ton Regular Cab Truck, Diesel - DRW with Traffic 2

Utility Storage
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Front Bumper Pole Pull and Traffic Utility Bed Offered:

Front Bumper Pole Pull and Traffic Utility Bed Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$69,794.00
$139,588.00

2022 Ford F350
Regular Cab 4x2
Chassis

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
330 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10-
Speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East

San Antonio, TX
78219

Diversified PPF-203
Post Puller Khapheide
PGNB-116 Bed

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$72,997.00
$145,994.00

2022 Ford F-350
Chassis Cab

Ford 6.7 Liter
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles

Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX
78230

CM Truck Bed
Tapco Post Puller

CM Truck Bed 2yr
limited warranty Tapco
Post puller limited
arranty manufacturer
only

140 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$80,770.00
$161,540.00

2022 Ram 3500
Cummans 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 360 hp
6 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
Motor

Any Ram

Any Ram

See Attachments full
build list

1yr.

150-200 est

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
24 3/4 Ton Regular Cab, Flatbed, with Vector Control 1

Attachments
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model Sprayer System Offered:

Sprayer System Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$44,480.00
$44,480.00

2022 Ford F250
Regular Cab 4x2
Ford 6.2L 2-valve
SOHC NA V8 385
H.P.

Ford Torgshift G
6- speed Auto
w/select shift
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East, San
Antonio, TX 78219
Vector Spray Unit

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$43,798.00
$43,798.00

2022 Ford F-250 Reg
Cab

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West San
Antonio, TX 78230

Stinger Sprayer
System

2 year limited

140 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$51,075.00
$51,075.00

2022 Ram 2500

Ram 6.4L Hemi V8
370 hp

8 spd auto

3 yr/36,000
5yr/100,000 limited
powertrain

Any Ram

Any Ram

Stinger 100 GX
Tyr.
150-210 EST

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
25 3/4 Ton Regular Cab Utility Service Truck w/Tow Hitch 3

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Utility Body Offered

Utility Body Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$44,982.00
$134,946.00

2022 Ford F250
Regular Cab 4x2
Ford 6.2L 2-valve
SOHC NA V8 385

Ford Torgshift-G

6 speed Automatic
Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East,
San Antonio, TX
78219

Knapheide 696

12 months
350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$47,298.00
$141,894.00

2022 Ford F-250 Reg
Cab

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX
78230

Redding Clasic

6 year limited

140 Days

TBD
November 15, 2021

Yes

$53,959.00
$161,877.00

2022 Ram 2500

Ram 6.4L Hemi V8
410 hp

8 spd auto
3/36,000 5/100,000
limited powertrain

Any Ram

Any Ram

Reading CL5089SW
6 yr.

150-210 EST
August 2022

March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
26 Crew Cab 4x2 Custom Bed Truck - Dual Rear Wheel 1

(DRW)
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Utility Body Offered
Utility Body Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$63,195.00
$63,195.00

2022 Ford F550 Crew
Cab 4x2 Chassis

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
330 H.P.

Ford Torgshift 10
speed Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East,
San Antonio, TX
78219

UT996TP UTEL

12 months
350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$54,997.00
$54,997.00

2022 Ford F350 Crew
Chassis

Ford 6.7 Liter]
Powerstroke Diesel

475 HP
10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West|
San Antonio, TX
78230

Redding Clasic 2

6 year limited

140 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$68,659.00
$68,659.00

2022 Ram 5500
Cummins 6.7L 16 Turb
Diesel 360 hp

6 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
Motor

Any Ram Business
Link

Any Ram Business
Link

CM RD 03976034SD
1yr.

150-210 Est

August 2022

March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
27 1 Ton 4 Door Cab 4x2 Stake Bed Truck - Dual Rear 1

Wheels
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make & Model of Utility Body Offered

Utility Body Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$47,172.00
$47,172.00

2022 Ford F350 Crew
Cab 4x2 Chassis

Ford 6.7L 4V OHV
Power Stroke V8
330

Ford Torgshift 10
speed Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavende Grande Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX|

78219
UTEL UT996TP

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021
10/30/2021

No

$56,991.00
$56,991.00

2022 Ford F-350 Crew
Chassis

Ford 6.7 Liter
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West

San Antonio, TX
78230

CM Truck Bed Timmy
Lift Gate

CM Truckbed 1 year
limited warranty
Tommy Lift 2 year
limited

140 Days
TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
28 Deleted
29 Medium Duty, Regular Cab, 16.5ft Stake/Flat Bed Truck 1
Price Each: No Bid $95,064.00 $113,737.00 No Bid No Bid $95,500.00
Total: $95,064.00 $113,737.00 $95,500.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Stake/Flatebed and Lift Gate Offered:

Stake/Flatebed and Lift Gate Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

2023 Ford F750
Regular Cab 4x2
Chassis

Ford 6.7L Power,
Stroke V8 270 H.P.

Ford Torgshift HD
6 speed Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio , TX|
78219

UTEC UT 16596 TP

12 months

350 Days

10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

2022 Ford F650

Ford 6.7 Liter
Powerstroke Diesel
300 HP

6 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX
78230

CM

Tommy Lift

2 year limited warranty
1 year limited warranty
140 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

2022 International
MV607

Cummins B6.7 280
HP

Allison 2500 RDS

See warranty
attachment page
Kyrish Truck Centers

1380 Ackerman Road
San Antonio, TX
78218

UT16.596TD Tommy
Gate 89-30 TP42 roll
Gate

1 year parts and labor

365 Days

1/1/22
12/22/21




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
30 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, DRW, 2-3 Cubic Yard, 9' Dump 1

Body

Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make and Model of Dump Body Offered:

Make and Model of Dump Body Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$64,066.00
$64,066.00

2022 Ford F350 4x2
Crew Cab Chassis
Ford 6.7L 4V OHV

Power Stroke V8

330 H.P.
Ford Torgshift 10
speed Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East,
San Antonio , TX|
78219

Warren U-9

12 months
350 Days
10/31/2021

10/31/2021

No

$60,989.00
$60,989.00

2022 Ford -350
Chassis Crew

Ford 6.7 Liter]
Powerstroke Diesel
475 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio, TX|
78230

Redding Dump Body

Redding Dump 3year
limited

140 Days
TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$68,995.00
$68,995.00

2022 Ram 3500

Cummins 6.7L 16
Turbo Diesel 360 hp

6 spd auto
3/36,000 5/100,000
Limited Powertrain +
motor

Any Ram Any Ram
Any Ram

Reading Merander
DBSMDR 108 DB
3 yr.

150-180 Est
August 2022

March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
31 Delete
32 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Utility Service Truck w/Tow Hitch, 1

Yellow
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Make and Model of Dump Body Offered:

Make and Model of Dump Body Warranty:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$47,564.00
$47,564.00

2022 Ford F250 Crew|
Cab 4x2

Ford 6.2L 2.valve
SOHC EFI NA V8 385
H.P.

Ford Torgshift-G 6
speed Auto

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East, San
Antonio , TX 78219

Knapeide 596
12 months
350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

$45,499.00
$45,499.00

2022Ford F-250 Crew

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic
3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford

8333 IH 10 West San
Antonio, TX 78230

Redding Classic 2
6 year limited

140 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

$53,425.00
$53,425.00

2022 Ram 2500

Ram 6.4L Hemi V8
410 hp

8 spd auto
3/36,000 5/100,000
limited powertrain
Any Ram

Any Ram

Reading Classic Il
CLS098SW

6yr.

180-250 EST
August 2022

March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
33 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X2/RWD, Long Bed, SRW, 3

Yellow
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$37,626.00
$112,878.00

2022 Ford F250 Crew
Cab 4x2

Ford 6.2L 2 valve
SOHC EFI NA V8

Ford Torgshift-G 6

speed Auto w/ select
shift

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East San
Antonio , TX 78219

350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

$31,391.00
$94,173.00

2022 Ford F-250 Crew

Ford 6.2 Liter EFI V8
385 HP

6 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West San
Antonio, TX 78230
140 Days

TBD

November 15, 20211

Yes

$40,658.00
$121,974.00

2022 Ram 2500

Ram 6.4L hemi V8
410 hp

8 spd auto

3/36,000 5/100,000
limited powertrain
Any Ram

Any Ram

180-250 Est

August 2022
March 2022

No

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
34 1/2 Ton Extended Cab 4x2/RWD Truck, Yellow 1

Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE
Net HP):

Transmission offered:

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

No Bid

$31,420.00
$31,420.00

2022 Ford F150
Super Cab 4x2 290
H.P.

Ford 3.3L V6 PFDI

Ford 10 speed
Automatic

Base 36 months or
36,000 miles
Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East San
Antonio , TX 78219

350 Days
10/30/2021

10/30/2021

No

$29,989.00
$29,989.00

2022 Ford F-150
Supercab

Ford 3.3 Liter V6 PFDI
290 HP

10 speed automatic

3yr/36,000 miles
5yr/100,000 miles
Red McComb's Ford
8333 IH 10 West San
Antonio, TX 78230
120 Days

TBD

November 15, 2021

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 11, 2021 Non Local Local Local Non Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Light and Medium Duty Service Vehicles Donaldson DCJR Cavender Grande Red McCombs Ford |Grapevine DCJ, LLC |Texas Pack and Load |Kyrish Truck Centers
Ford
6100014555 LD 11211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. |4562 IH-10 East 8333 I-10 Building 1 [25601 William Tate 1030 Brussel St. 1380 Ackerman Rd.
Item Description Quantity Silsbee, San Antonio, San Antonio Grapevine, San Antonio, San Antonio
TX 77656 TX 78219 Texas 78230 TX 76051 TX 78219 TX 78219
409-880-9191 210-661-4121 210-349-4949 817-410-7541 210-239-2282
35 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Truck 4x4/AWD Long Bed, Lift Gate, 1
Brush Guard
Price Each: No Bid $50,968.00 $50,988.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $50,968.00 $50,988.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Ford F250 Crew||2022 Ford F-250 Crew
Cab 4x4 4x4
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Ford 6.7L 4V OHV Ford 6.7 Liter
Net HP): Power Stroke V8 Powerstroke Diesel
475 H.P. 475 HP
Transmission Offered: Ford Torgshift 10| 10 speed automatic
speed Automatic
Warranty: Base 36 months or] 3yr/36,000 miles
36,000 miles 5yr/100,000 miles
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cavender Grande| Red McComb's Ford
Ford
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East 8333 IH 10 West
San Antonio , TX| San Antonio, TX
78219 78230
Lift Gate Offered: Maxon C2-60-1542 Tommy Lift Gate
TP
Lift Gate Warranty: 12 months 2 year limited
Delivery 350 Days 140 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/30/2021 TBD
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract 10/30/2021|| November 15, 2021
without missing the production cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted, No Yes
after the production cut-off date?
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $392,225.00 $2,721,669.00 $2,657,822.50 $2,843,225.00 $68,998.00 $199,500.00
Total Award: $392,225.00 $838,352.00 $1,721,438.00 $319,189.00 $68,998.00

Deleted: Items 1, 8, 28 and 31 will be re-bid at a later date.
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